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11/19/2018 {o Re: Office Action Issued: Eurasian Patent Application No. 201... - Srinivas DS
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This email and any files transmilled with it are confidential and intended to be received only by the individual or entity to whom they are
‘addressed. If you are not the intended recipient you are netifiad that it is STRICTLY PROHIBITED to disclose, use, copy or distribute this
transmission or its contents. Please nolify the sender immedialely if you have received this email in error and delete this email from your
system. Chadha & Chadha accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus unwillingly transmitted by this email,

On Tue, May 29, 2018 at 5:57 PM Garima Sethi <garima.sethi@ipratiorneys.coms> wrote:
REARLINE: JUNE 21, 2018

. RESPONSE REQUESTED BY: MAY 30,2018

. Dear Mr Devathi,

j i
’ . | Please be advised that the term for filing a response in Eyrasia can be extended

for unlimited number of months upon payment of the prescribed Official extension fee.
The amount of the Official fee is RUR 1000 (about EUR 16.00 (USD 17.0)) for each of the
first two months. For each subsequent month the extension fee is increased by RUR 1000
| ~ (about EUR 16.00 (USD 17.00)) per month up to the twelfth month, and by RUR 1250
! © (about EUR 20.00 (USD 21.0)) per month starting from the thirteenth month.
This applicant is authorized to pay 50% of all official fees.
| Examnle:
- 1St month - 17%0.5 = 8.5 USD
2" month - 17*0.5 = 8.5 USD
3" month - (17+17)*0.5 = 17 USD
4% month - (17417+17)*0.5 = 25.5 USD
| 5t month = (17+17+17+17)%0.5 = 34 USD
- And so on up to the 13" month,

It

a0 i
Extension can be requested manth-by-month or for several months at a

- time. The professional fee for filing_one extension request is YSD 125,

Therefore, please advise us urgently the time period for which you wish to seek
- extension, so that we may send you our invoice for advance payment accordingly.

- Best Regards Q'B -

.

Garima Sethi (Ms.)
~ Managing Associale | Patent Agent

hltps:Hou!Ionk;of_ﬁce.com/owaf?vlewmodel=RaadMessagelzem&IternID=AAMkAGU4OGQOMdeLWUdYWElNDE4NiDsNDAzLTYOZijNzExNjMSYw = BA0
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Re: Office Action Issued: Eurasian Palent Application No, 201... - Srinivas DS
CHADHA & CHADHAT Intellectual Property Law Firm

Head Qffice: Level 18, One Horizon Center, Golf Course Road, DLF Phase 5, Sector 43, Gurgaon, Haryana 122002 (National Capilal
Reglon), INDIA

Tel: +01-124- 668 8014 | Fax: +81-124- 668 8020 | Mobile: +91-9560318761

info@iprattorneys.com | www.ipraltorneys. com
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended to be received only by the individual or entity 1o whom
they are addressed. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that il is STRICTLY PROHIBITED to disclose, use, copy
or distribute this transmission or its contents. Please nolify the sender immediately if you have received this email in error and
delete this email from your syslem, Chadha & Chadha accepls no liability for any damage caused by any virus unwillingly
transmitted by this email.

- On Mon, May 28, 2018 at 2:36 PM Srinivas DS <grinivas@z3cars.coms> wrote:

Garima, [ thought we went over this,

[ asked you for time extension options for both Eurasia and Japan. Kindly let me know.
Thanks,

DS

Sent from my iPad

On May 28, 2018, at 1:06 PM, Garima Sethi <garima.sethi@iprattorneys.coms wrote:

NT N

DEADLINE: JUNE 21, 2018

RESPONSE REQUESTED BY: MAY 30, 2018
Dear Mr. Devathi,

Kindly confirm us by May_30, 2018 if you wish to proceed in this matter as
the agents may not take any. action in case of delayed instructions,

Furthermore,_an urgency fee would also be charged as the matter involves
transition as well,

Looking forward to hearing from you urgently by May 30, 2018.

Best Regards

Garima Sethi (Ms.)
Managing Associate | Patent Agent

CHADHA & CHADHA | Intellectual Property Law Firm

i
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11/19/2018 ) Re: Office Action Issued: Eurasian Patent Application No, 201... - Srinivas DS

On Fri, May 4, 2018 at n:50 AM Garima Sethi <garima_sethi@iprattorneys.coms
wrote:

REMINDER
Best Regards

Garima Sethi (Ms.)
Managing Associate | Patent Agent

CHADHA & CHADHA | Intellectual Property Law Firm

Head Office: Level 18, One Horizon Center, Golf Course Road, DLF Phase 5, Sector 43, Gurgaon, Haryana
122002 (National Capital Region), INDIA

Tel: £91:124: 668 8014 | Fax: £1:124: 658 8020 | Mobile: +91:9560318761

nfo@ipratiorneys.com | www.ipratlorneys,com
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This email and any files lransmitted with it are confidential and intended to be received only by the individual or
entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not the intended recipient you are nolified that it is
STRICTLY PROHIBITED to disclose, use, copy or distribute this transmissien or its contents, Please nolify he
N e i sender immediately if you have received this email in error and delete this email from your system, Chadha
i i & Chadha accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus unwillingly transmitted by this email.

On Tue, Apr 10, 2018 at 10:15 AM, Garima Sethi "
" <garima sethi@iprattorneys.coms> wrote:
 KIND REMINDER

DEADLINE: JUNE 21, 2018
RESPONSE REQUESTED BY: APRIL 20, 2018

. Best Regards

{ _ ', i - - Garima Sethi (Ms.)
s, * Senior Associate | Patent Agent

CHADHA & CHADHA 1 Intellectual Property Law Firm

Head Office: Level 18, One Horizon Center, Golf Course Road, DLF Phase 5, Seclor 43, Gurgaon, Haryana
122002 (National Capital Region). INDIA

Tel: #91-124- 668 8014 | Fax: +91-124- 668 8020 | Mobile: +91-9560318761

On Thu, Mar1s, 2018 at 1:01 M, Garima Sethi
<garima sethi@iprattorneys.coms wrote:

3
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11119/2018 - _ Re: Office Action Issued: Eurasian Patent Application No. 201... - Srinivas DS
Dear Sir,

Please be advised that the agents may provide a summary of office
action and the estimated cost for the same would be USD 155.

Please let us know if you wish to proceed.

Best Regards

Garima Sethi (Ms.)
Senior Associate | Patent Agent

CHADHA & CHADHA | Intellectual Property Law Firm

Head Office: Level 18, One Horlzon Center, Golf Course Road, DLF Phase 5, Sector 43, Gyrgaon,
Haryana 122002 (National Capital Region), INDIA

Tel: #91-124- 668 8014 | Fax; +91-124- 668 8020 | Mobile: +91-9560314761

info@ipratiorneys.com L www.iprallomeys.com
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended to be received only by the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not the inlended recipient you are notified
thatitis STRICTLY PROHIBITED to disclose, use, copy or distribyte this transmission or its

. ! ‘ conlents. Please nolify the sender immediatsly if you have received this email in error and delele this
email from your system. Chadha & Chadha accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus
unwillingly transmitted by this email.

On Mon, Mar 12, 2018 at 5:07 PM, Srinivas DS <srinjvas@z3¢ars.com>
wrote:

How do we know what is the OA (and our response should be) without
English translation?

Can your legal counterparts over there provide a English summary of
OA?

DS

- Sent from my iPad

On Mar 1z, 2018, at 4:56 PM, Garima Sethi
<garima.sethi@iprattorneys.coms wrote:

{ : Dear Sir,
5 Please find enclosed a copy of the Office Action issued
L5 in respect to the above-identified patent application
P along with our debit note. A response to the Office Action

https:Houllook.oﬁice.coﬁlcwa/?v%ewmode!=ReadMessageltem&llem|D=AAMKAGU4OGQOMDd;‘LWU4YWElNDEdN:OSNDAZLTYDZ]FmNzExN]M5Yw,‘. 8o




111972018 Re: Qffice Action Issued: Eurasian Patent Application No, 201... - Srinivas DS

must be filed within 4 months from the mailing date

stamped on the litle page i.e. by 21 June 2018. .
The term can be extended for unlimited number of

months upon payment of the prescribed extension fee.

In case you wish to receive the english translation of the
attached office Action, please let us know. Kindly note

that the same would be chargeable at USD 26/ 100

words and we would require advance payment o initiate
the process.

Please kind|y_note that if no response is §gpmit:g1:gi
n..szt.u.d.ue..damg.__e.s._w nsion i ir pr
the dye date) the application w| ider
withdrawn, However, the abandoned application can

red within a year fr i
Please confirm receipt of this email and the attached
files.

We look forward to receiving your instructions on this
matter.

Best Regards b

Garima Sethi (Ms.)
Senior Associate | Patent Agent

CHADHA & CHADHA | Intellectual Property Law Firm

Head Office: Level 18, One Horizon Center, Golf Course Road, DLF Phase 5,
Sector 43, Gurgaon, Haryana 122002 (National Capital Region), INDIA

i ; ; Tel: +91-124- 668 8014 | Fax: +91-124- 668 8020 | Mobile: +91-9560318761

info@iprattorneys.com | www.iprattorneys.com
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This email and any files lransmilled with it are confidential and intended to be

‘ received only by the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you are not
the inlended recipient you are notified that it is STRICTLY PROHIBITED to
disclose, usa, copy or distribule this transmission or its contenls, Please nolify lhe
sender immadiately |l you have received this email in error and delele this email
from your syslem. Chadha & Chadha accepls no liability for any damage caused
by any virus unwillingly transmitled by this email,

<OA1-RUS_P-541-4EA_2018-02-21.pd(>

<invoice-P17784.pdf>

<Eurasian analysis.xlsx>

https:ﬁoulluok.ofﬁpe.com!owa/?viewmodel=ReadMessagallem&IlemlD=AAMkAGU4OGOOMdeLWUdYWElNDEdNiOSNDAzLTYOZijNzExNjMSY... 10/10
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2011/2019 - Mail - Srinivas DS - Qullook

Re: Upcoming action items on applications

Garima Sethi
Mon 2/11/2019 9:33 AM

To: Srinivas DS <srinivas@z3cars.com>
Cc: chetan chadha <chetan.chadha@iprattorneys.com>; CHA212 <patents@iprattorneys.com>;
Taryn Gandhi <tarun.gandhi@iprattorneys.com>

Dear Mr. Devathi,

Thank you for your email.

gggg note that as advised earlier we shall not be able take any action in respect of any of the below
vavwmgwmwvw
QM&JWJ&L&MQ&&&JM&

Best Regards

Garlma Sethi (Ms.)

Partner I'Attorney at'Law and Patent Attorney
CHADHA & CHADHA I Intellectual Property Law Firm
Head Qffice: Level 18, One Horizon Center, Golf Course Road, DLF Phase 5, Sector 43, Gurgaon, Haryana 122002 (National Capital Region), INDIA

Tel: +91-124- 668 8014 | Fax: +81-124- 668 8020 | Mobile: +91-9560318761

info@ipratiorneys.com | www. ipratlorneys.com
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This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and Intended to be received only by the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you
are not the intendad reciplent you are notified that it is STRICTLY PROMIBITED to disclose, use, copy or distribute this transmission or its

contents. Please nalify the sender immedialely if you have received this email in error and delete this email from your system, Chadha & Chadha
accepts no iiability' for any damage caused by any virus unwillingly transmitted by this email.

On Fri, Feb 8,2019 at 3:18 PM Srinivas DS <sriniva i@JQQ_LQQ_R wrote:
Dear Garuna,

i

' Thanks fdr giving the requested information.
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—~ 2112019 i Mail - Srinivas DS - Qutlook

One last question relevant for next few days. Korea response is due by Feb 18th; and you have given
extension of time options. Can [ exercise the extension option before paying the 3 Lakhs that is
requested? Or that is also not doable as per your management guidelines?

Kindly check with your management and let me know.

Thanks,

Srinivas DS

CEO

Z3Cars Private Limited

Website: www.Z3Cars.com

Frbm: Garima Sethi <garima,sethi@iprattorneys.coms>
Sent: Thursday, February 7, 2019 3:55 PM

To: Srinivas DS

Cc: chetan chadha; CHA212; Tarun Gandhi

Subject: Re: Upcoming action items on applications

Dear Mr. Devathi,
Please note that following costs would be incurred in respect of Japan proceedings
Option (1) (demanding an appeal trial): JPY 397,000

? Option (2) (filing a divisional application (parent application will be withdrawn after
- demanding appeal trial): JPY 470,000

' Best Regards

Garima Sethi (Ms.)

. Partner I Attorney at Law and Patent Altorney

'

- CHADHA & CHADHA Intellectual Property Law Firm

Head Office: L.evel 18, One Horizon Cenler, Golf Course Road, DLF Phase 5, Sector 43, Gurgaon, Haryana 122002 (National Capilal Region), INDIA
Tel: +91-124- 668 8014 | Fax: +91-124- 668 8020 | Mobile: +91-9560318761

info@iprattorneys.com | www.ipratiormeys.com
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Re: Upcoming action items on applications

Garima Sethi
Wed 1/30/2019 8:39 PM

To: Srinivas DS <srinivas@z3cars.com>

Cc: chetan chadha <chetan.chadha@iprattorneys.com>; CHA212 <patents@iprattorneys.com>;
Tarun Gandhi <tarun.gandhi@iprattorneys.com>

Dear Mr, Devathi,

Thank you for your e-mail.
[ have discussed with Mr. Chetan. Please note that we will able to proceed with your matters once you
pay 3 lakhs from your pending dues plus pay the incremental fee for the upcoming matters.

Best Regards

Garima Sethi (Ms.)

Partner | Attorney at Law and Patent Attorney

CHADHA & CHADHA 1 Intellectual Property Law Firm

Head Qffice: Level 18, One Horizon Center, Galf Course Road, DLF Phase 5, Sector 43, Gurgaon, Haryana 122002 (National Capital Regicn), INDIA
Tel: +91-124- 668 8014 | Fax: +91-124- 668 8020 | Mobile: +g1-g§§g§1_ 8761

info@ipraltorneys.com | www.iprattorneys.com
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This email and arlly files transmilted with it are confidential and intended to be received only by the individual or entity to whom they are adiressed‘ If you
are not the intended recipient‘yau are notified that it is STRICTLY PROHIBITED to disclose, use, copy or distribute this transmission or its

contents, Please nolify the sender immediately if you have received this email in error and delete this email from your system. Chadha & Chadha
accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus unwillingly transmitted by this email,

On Wed, Jan 30, 2019 at 10:56 PM Srinivas DS <grinivas@z3cars.com> wrote:
! Dear Mr, Chetan

[ need to gj;ggugg this matter with you at your earliest convenience. The valuations of these IP
snnhﬂmmmmmdyjﬂg&mumlmdjmﬂmymwumu
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Mail - Srinivas DS - Qutlook

- Japan, Kovea and Australia applications, by paying the incremental fegs,

[ owe your firm abwout 4.4 lakhs and I shall pay it by end of February. :

Over the last few days, both Tarun and Garima are not accessible on their mobile phones and | have not
received any updates from them.

Kindly consider this e-mail seriously (given the magnitude of its impact to India); and allow the
requested filings. I look forward to your comments.

Thanks,

Srinivas DS

CEO

Z3Cars Private Limited
Website: www.Z3Cars.com

. From: Srinivas DS

Sent: Wednesday, January 23, 2019 4:06 PM
To: Taryn Gandhi

. Cc: CHA212; chetan ghadha; Garima Sethi

Subject: Re: Upcoming action items on applications

Dear Tarun / Chetan,

. Here is a kind request to accommodate work on Japan, Korea and Australia applications before Feb end.

Once again, I confirm that this is the last extension I seek and you could (reeze the account by Feb end if

' 1do not clear the past balance. Note that I will pay_the incremental expenses for these
- applications worlc,

- Here is-the estimated sale price of these applications (loss if | lose the application):

' 1).Japan -8 Trillion s
' 2) Korea - 5 Trillion s

3).Aystralia - 2,7 Trillion §

- My income loss and thus India’s progress and development wealth will diminish by that much if [ lose

one or more of these applications.

| Kindly make exception and allow work 3applications, before Feb end.

Thanks,
© Srinivas DS
 CEO :
- Z3Cars Private Limited

- Website: www.Z3Cars.com

i
H

t
1
H
i
|

|

From: Srinivas DS

| Sent: Monday, January 14, 2019 4:44:02 PM
| To: Tarun Gandhi Qﬁ
! Cc: CHA212; chetan chadha; Garima Sethi e

Subject: Re: Upcoming action items on applications

https:/loutlgok.office.com/mail/deeplink?popoutv2=1 2/5




2152019 Mail - Srinivas DS - Qutlook

Deér Tarun / Chetan,

Kindly accommodate work on Japan, Korea and Australia applications before Feb end.
Once again, I confirm that this is the last extension | seek and you could freeze the account by Feb end if

I do not clear the past balance. Note that | will pay the incremental expenses for these
applications work.

Here is the estimated sale price of these applications (loss if I lose the application):

“1).Japan - 8 Trillion ¢
- 2)Korea - 5 Trillion §
‘ 3).5;::3@111;&7.1&111@.&

My incomie loss and thus India's progress and development wealth will diminigh by that much if I lose
- one or more of these applications.

Kindly make exception and allow work on these 3 applications, before Feb end. !

Thanks, :
- Srinivas DS
| CEQ-

- Z3Cars Private Limited
- Website: www.Z3Cars,com

P 4 A e e A

- Fram: Srinivas DS

- Sent: Wedhesday, January 2, 2019 2:28 PM

© To: Taryn Gandhi

~ Ce'CHA212; chetan chadha; Garima Sethi

- Subject: Ré: Upcoming action items on applications

Dear Tarun / Chetan,

: 3
: l.l'.ﬁ_ﬂllﬁﬁl- You tQ provi n extension nal 2 month pay.off the balance and in the interim allow
the response / action filing pertaining to Japan, Korea and Australia, These are 3 important markets ’

coming up and loss of rights runs into Trillions () of income for me and India. Note that I shall pay.the
- incremental response / action filing costs.

. Ishall certainly be able to pay off all the past pending balance before February end to bring the account
current.

- Kindly accommodate this one last request of mine; and provide a final 2 ;month extension to pay
- offthe balance.

. Thanks,

* Srinivas DS
CEO
. Z3Cars Private Limited ﬁ 1

- Website: www.Z3Cars.com

https:lloutlook.oﬁice.corn,'maiHdeepliﬁk?pcpouwzﬂ 3/5 {
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Mail - Srinivas DS - Qutlook

- From:'Garima Sethi <garima.sethi@iprattorneys.com>
Sent: Wednisday, January 2, 2019 12:06 PM
To: Srinivas DS
Cc: Tarun Gandhi; CHA212
Subject: Re: Upcoming action items on applications

Dear Mr. Devathi,

Please note that as per your earlier commitment our dues were to be cleared by Degcember 31,

2018, rlowever, since this has not been taken care of at your end we will not be able to extend you
our services any further.

We shall not be able take any action in respect of any of the below mentioned matters or
- @ny of your other matters/queries as long as pending dues are cleared.

gﬂggrmgrg we shall not be responsible for any loss of rights in regard to any
- of your matters.

- Best Regards

Garima Sethi (Ms.)
 Managing Associate | Patent Agent

'_ CHADHA & CHADHA | Intellectual Properly Law Firm
| Head Office: Level 18, One Horizon Center, Golf Course Road, DLF Phase 5, Secter 43, Gurgaon, Haryana 122002 (National Capilal Region), INDIA

Tel: +§1-124- 668 B014 [ Fax: +91-124- 668 8020 | Mgbile: +91-9560318751
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! This emall and any filss transmitted with il are confidential and Intended lo be received only by the individual or entity to whom they ar% addressed. If
~ you are not the intended recipient you are notified that it is STRICTLY PROHIBITED to disclose, use, copy or distribute this transmission or its

i tontents. Please notify the sender immediately if you have recelved this email in error and delete this email from your system. Chadha & Chadha
accepts no liability for any damage caused by any virus unwillingly transmitted by this email,
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